BID NAME: 2020 Submersible Pumps & Related Materials

Bid Opening: November 13, 2019

3:00 P.M.

Number of Bids Received:

LaPlace, LA 70068
www.sjbparish.com

ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH
1811 West Airline Highway

ITEM

Description

Bidder & Address

Bidder & Address

Bidder & Address

Allan Harris Co. Inc.

616 Papworth Ave.
Metaire, LA. 70005

Delta Process Equipment Inc.
3017 21st Street, Suite #209
Metairie LA. 70002

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump, 3 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 100 Gpm At 32"
Head To 480 Gpm At 5' Head Shutoff Head 40’

$3,350.00

$3,516.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump, 5 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 40'
Head To 540 Gpm At 12' Head Shutoff Head 49'

$3,980.00

$3,739.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump, 7.5 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 48'
Head To 600 Gpm At 16' Head Shutoff Head 53'

$4,490.00

$4,291.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump, 5 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 42"
Head To 750 Gpm At 7' Head Shutoff Head 47'

$3,980.00

$3,739.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 7.5 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 52"
Head To 800 Gpm At 13' Head Shutoff Head 58'

$4,490.00

$4,291.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 10 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 58'
Head To 900 Gpm At 13' Head Shutoff Head 63'

$4,950.00

$4,979.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 15 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 100 Gpm At 72"
Head To 850 Gpm At 18' Head Shutoff Head 80'

$6,480.00

$6,206.00

4" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 20 H.P.,l%o
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 100 Gpm At 92"
Head To 1,150 Gpm At 14' Head Shutoff Head 98'

$6,990.00

$7,298.00

6" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 5 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 42"
Head To 750 Gpm At 7' Head Shutoff Head 47'

$5,220.00

No Bid

10

6" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 7.5 H.P., 1750
Rpm 3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 52"
Head To 800 Gpm At 13' Head Shutoff Head 58'

$5,500.00

No Bid

11

6" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 10 H.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 80 Gpm At 58' Head To 900
Gpm At 13' Head Shutoff Head 63'

$5,850.00

No Bid

No responsive/responsible bidder

12

6" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 15 H.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 100 Gpm At 72' Head To 850 Gpm
At 18' Head Shutoff Head 80’

$7,050.00

$7,367.00

13

6" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 20 H.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 100 Gpm At 92' Head To
1,150 Gpm At 14' Head Shutoff Head 98'

$7,800.00

$8,217.00

14

" submersible Solid Handling Pump 25 H.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 200 Gpm At 65' Head To 1,800
Gpm At 22' Head Shutoff Head 70

$8,550.00

$11,354.00

15

6" Submersible Solid Handling Pump 30 HL.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 200 Gpm At 75' Head To 2,000
Gpm At 22' Head Shutoff Head 82"

$9,580.00

$12,590.00

16

" submersible Solid Handling Pump 40 H.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 200 Gpm At 94' Head To 2,400
Gpm At 35' Head Shutoff Head 1100

No Bid

$13,878.00

17

6" submersible Solid Handling Pump 50 HL.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 200 Gpm At 105' Head To 2,400
Gpm At 35' Head Shutoff Head 110

No Bid

$15,786.00

18

" submersible Solid Handling Pump, 60 H.P., 1750 Rpm
3/60/230/460 Design Criteria 200 Gpm At 115' Head To 2,300
Gpm At 50" Head Shutoff Head 125

No Bid

$18,060.00
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