ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH

From the Olffice of Purchasing & Procurement Director Peter Montz

January 26. 2022

Allen J. Harris Co. Inc.
Michael Stackpole
616 Papworth Ave
Metairie, LA 70005

RE: Bid Item: 2021.26 Submersible Pumps
Bid Date: December 10, 2021

Dear Michael Stackpole.

We are pleased to advise that on Tuesday January 25, 2022 your bid for “2021.26 Submersible Pumps”
was approved by the St. John the Baptist Parish Council.

Enclosed is a copy of the bid tabulation and Parish Council Approved Resolution.
Thank you for your interest in doing business with St. John the Baptist Parish. If you have any questions

regarding this award, please contact, Peter Montz, Purchasing Director, at (985) 652- 9569 or
p.montz@stjohn-la.gov.

We look forward to doing business with vou.
Sincerely,

Jaclyn Hotard
Parish President

H/en

1811 WEST AIRLINE HiGHWAY | LAPLACE, LouisiaNa 70068 | 985-652-9569 | FAX 985-652-4131 | WWW.SJBPARISH.COM



C.J. SAVOIE /e
CONSULTING ENGINEERS, INC. DESIGNERS

PLANNERS

January 5, 2022

Mr. Peter Montz,

Purchasing and Procurement Director
St. John the Baptist Parish

1811 W. Airline Highway

LaPlace, Louisiana 70068

RE: St. John the Baptist Parish
Submersible Pump Bids

Dear Mr. Montz:

| have reviewed all bids submitted by the Supplier's on December 10, 2021, for the
St. John the Baptist Parish Submersible Pump Project. Please find enclosed a copy of
the breakdown tabulation for the bids received. Four bids were received. One bidder
failed to meet the specifications with the data provided, two bidders failed to properly
complete the Louisiana State Public Works Bid Form. At this time, | am recommending
award of this contract to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, which appears to
be Allan J. Harris Co. Inc., for Bid Items 1 through 16 as other bidders were considered
non-responsive. No responsive Bids were received for Iltems 17 through 19.

Should you have any additional questions, please contact me.

Thanks,

Clarence J. Savoie, Ill, P.E.
C.J. Savoie Consulting Engineers, Inc.

P.O.DRAWER R ¢ PAINCOURTVILLE, LOUISIANA 70391  (985) 369-2341 ¢ FAX (985) 369-7735
Email: cjs@cjsavoie.com



ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH

SUBMERSIBLE PUMP
Bid Date: December 10, 2021
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

RED RIVER PUMP | DELTA PROCESS WASTEWATER
ALLAN J. HARRIS | gppeialisTs, INC. EQUIPMENT SOLUTIONS, LLC

ftem Description Quantity | Unit Price Cost Unit Price Cost Unit Price Cost Unit Price Cost
1 o2* SUBMERSIBLE SUMP PUMP 1.5 HP 3450 RPM, 1/60/230 LS LS 5 1,450.00| $ 145000 § 145000 % 1,450.00 $ 1,54400| § 1,544.00 NO BID NQ BID

4" SUBMERSIBLE SCLID HANDLING PUMP, 3 H.P,, 1750 RPM
2 {3/80/230/480 DESIGN CRITERIA 100 GPM AT 32° HEAD TO 480 Ls L3 |% 398000 $ 3980.00)3% 3,450.00;5 345000]% 44440013 444400|% 90620018 906200
GPM AT 5 HEAD SHUTCOFF HEAD 40

4" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 5 H.P., 1780 RPM
3 |3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 40" HEAD TO 540 LS LS |$ 455000 $ 4550005 405000 % 40500018 47250013 472500(% 10,565.00)3% 10,555.00
GPM AT 12 HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 49

4" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 7.5 H.P., 1750 RPM
4 |a/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 48' HEAD TO 600 18 LS |§ 485000 % 4,850.00]% 442500|% 442500|% 533600 8% 5336.00;% 9506500(% 950500
GPM AT 16" HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 53'

4" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 5 H.P., 1750 RPM
5 |3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 42 HEAD TO 750 LS LS |$ 4,550.00| 5 4,560.00| % 4,05000]% 406000|% 4725001% 472500 § 10,555.00|% 10,555.00
GPM AT 7' HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 47°

4" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 7.5 H.P., 1750 RPM
&  [3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 52' HEAD TC 800 18 IS 1% 4,850.00] § 4,350.00 | F 44250003 442500[% 5,336.00(§ 533600(F% 505003 9,505.00
GPM AT 13 HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 58

4" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 10 H.E., 1750 RPM
7 |3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 58 HEAD TO 200 s Ls s sz20000| % 520000(% 5225000% 52260008 622200]8§ 62220003 9778003 8778.00
GPM AT 13' MEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 63'

4" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 15 H.P., 1750 RPM
8 |3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 100 GPM AT 72° HEAD TO 850 LS LS |% 6,200.00] $ 6,20000| % B52500(% 6525001 % 7535000 % 7,53500(% 12,291.001 8 1229100
GPM AT 18" HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 80'

4" SUBMERS!BLE SCLID HANDLING PUMP, 20 H.P., 1750 RPM
¢ l3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 100 GPM AT 82' HEAD TC 1,150 LS 1S 1$ 785000 % 7350.00|% 695000 % 6,850,008 7.750.00(% 7.750.00( % 17,12200)§ 17,122.00
GPM AT 14' MEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 98’

6" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 6 H.P., 1750 RPM
10 [3/50/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 42' HEAD TO 750 L3 LS | % 5850.060; % 585000 % 5675.00|¢% 567500 NO BID NO BID $ 10,849.00| § 10,849.00
GPM AT 7' HEAD SHUTOFF READ 47

&" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 7.5 H.P, 1750 RPM
11 |3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 80 GPM AT 52' HEAD TC 800 LS LS $ &,000.00{ § 6,000.00f % 5,92000 § 502000 NO BID NG BID $ 10,849.00] § 10,849.00
GPM AT 13 HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 58'




12

6" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 10 H.P,, 1750 RPM
3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERA 80 GPM AT 58 HEAD TO 900
GPM AT 13" HEAD SHUTCFF HEAD 63

LS

LS

6,300.00

$ 6.300.00

6,150.00

€,150.00

NO BID

NO BID

%

10,849.00

10,848.00

13

5" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 16 H.P., 175C RPM
3/60/2301460 DESIGN CRITERIA 100 GPM AT 72' HEAD TO 850
GPM AT 18 HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 80

LS

LS

8,800.00

$ 8,800.00

7.225.00

7,225.00

£,055.00

3 9,055.00

15,782.00

15,782.00

5" SUBMERSIBLE SCLID HANDLING PUMP, 20 H.P.,, 1750 RPM
3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 100 GPM AT 92' HEAD TO 1,150
GPM AT 14' HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 68'

LS

Ls

$

8,200.00

$  9,:200.00

8,750.00

8,750.00

10,131.00

$ 10,131.00

13,310.00

13,310.00

15

6" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 25 H.P,, 1750 RPM
3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 200 GPM AT 65' HEAD TO 1,800
GPM AT 22' HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 70

LS

Ls

§

10,800.00

$ 10,800.00

§,550.00

8,550.00

15,458.00

§ 15458.00

12,814.00

12,814.00

5" SUBMERSIBLE SCLID HANDLING PUMP, 30 H.P., 1750 RPM
3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 200 GPM AT 75' HEAD TO 2,000
GPM AT 22' HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 82'

LS

LS

$

12,000.00

$ 12,000.00

3

10,530.00

3

10,580.00

17,161.00

$ 17,161.00

13,310.00

15,310.00

17

8" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 40 H.P.,, 1750 RPM
WB0/230M60 DESIGN CRITERIA 200 GPM AT 84' HEAD TO 2,400
GPM AT 38" HEAD SHUTCFF HEAD 1,100

LS

LS

NO BID

NO BID

¥

13,775.00

$

13,775.00

17,161.00

$ 17,161.00

21,950.00

21,850.00

18

&' SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 50 H.P., 1750 RPM
3/60/230/460 DESIGN CRITERIA 200 GPM AT 105' HEAD TO 2,400
GPM AT 35" HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 110

LS

LS

NO BID

NC BIiD

kS

17,850.00

$

17,850.00

19,656.00

$ 19,666.00

35,389,00

35,399.00

19

6" SUBMERSIBLE SOLID HANDLING PUMP, 60 H.P., 1760 RPM
360/230/450 DESIGN CRITERIA 200 GPM AT 115" HEAD TO 2,300
GPM AT 80 HEAD SHUTOFF HEAD 125"

LS

LS

NO BID

NO BID

&

20,075.00

$

20,075,060

22,5584.00

$ 2255400

35,369.00

35,389.00

TOTAL

102,430.00

146,100.00

158,783.00

268,564.00




ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH COUNCIL
STATE OF LOUISIANA

RESOLUTION
R22-7

Councilman _Madere proposed and Councilman Malik seconded the following resolution:

THE ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH COUNCIL HEREBY RESOLVES:

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH TO AWARD THE BID
FOR THE 2022 SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS & RELATED MATERIALS TO ALLAN J. HARRIS
CO. INC.

WHEREAS, Article IV, Section H (2) and (5) of the St. John the Baptist Parish Home Rule Charter
permits the Parish Council to adopt a resolution when authorizing a designated person(s) to execute a previously
approved contract on its behalf and/or to perform a ministerial act related to the administrative business of the Parish;
and

WHEREAS, Allan J. Harris Co. Inc. of Metairie, LA submitted the lowest responsive and responsible
bid; and,

WHEREAS, orders will be placed on an as-needed basis and is funded through the Utilities Budget.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the St. John the Baptist Parish Council, St. John the
Baptist Parish is hereby authorized to award the bid for the 2022 Submersible Pumps & Related Materials to Allan J.
Harris Co. Inc.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

YEAS: Madere, Becnel, Torres, Houston, Wright, Duhe-Griffin, Arcuri, Schnyder, Malik
NAYS: None

ABSTAIN: None

ABSENT: None

And, the resolution was declared adopted on this, the 25" day of _January 2022.

YLk

Council Chaj

Secretary

Approved: X




Veto:

arish President

* % ok ok ¥

CGERTILEIEA TE

I, Jackie Landeche, Secretary of the Council of the Parish of St. John, State of Louisiana, hereby certify that
the foregoing is a true and correct copy of a resolution adopted by the St. John Parish Council in regular meeting
held on the _25™ day of _January 2022.

Signed at Laplace, Louisiana thisgiay of

(S EATL) ecretary
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