
Company 
Name and 
Address

Ferguson 
Enterprise DBA 
Louisiana Utilities 
Supply Co  901 
South Labarre Rd. 
Ste 206 Metairie, 
LA 70001

Coburn's 
Supply      
1300 
Ridgefield RD. 
Thibodaux, LA 
70301

Cimsco, Inc. 
1840 L and A 
Rd. Metairie, 
LA 70001

Baton Rouge 
Winwater 
Works 8940 
Buzbee Dr. 
Baton Rouge, 
LA 70809

Section 1 $1.62 $2.30 $1.84 $1.64
Section 2 $4.10 $4.45 $6.25 $6.16
Section 3 $484.52 $711.67 $935.18 $791.13
Section 4 $5,405.60 No Bid $6,675.00 $6,506.75
Section 5 No Bid No Bid $132.00 $415.00
Section 6 $1,220.00 $1,397.23 $1,364.00 $1,228.75
Section 7 $263.00 $458.17 $201.00 $243.00
Section 8 $203.00 $197.24 $219.00 $244.00
Section 9 $229.00 $211.16 $392.00 $389.00
Section 10 $7,123.00 $8,341.50 $7,445.00 $8,480.00
Section 11 $1,216.00 No Bid $2,403.00 $1,410.00
Section 12 $2,101.05 $2,196.53 $2,225.75 $2,167.40
Section 13 $48.00 $117.28 $123.00 $109.00
Section 14 No Bid No Bid $144.00 $50.00
Section 15 $5,101.50 No Bid $3,994.00 No Bid
Section 16 No Bid No Bid $805.00 No Bid
Section 17 No Bid $415.05 $991.00 No Bid
Section 18 $180.85 $827.71 $272.50 No Bid
Section 19 No Bid $130.00 $179.00 $1,000.00

2020.15  Water & Sewage Fittings Bid Tabulation               Bid Date:  November 13, 2020           Number of Bids: 4

     St. John the Baptist Parish Council                                                                                                        
Water & Sewage Fittings 
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Company 
Name and 
Address

Ferguson 
Enterprise DBA 
Louisiana Utilities 
Supply Co  901 
South Labarre Rd. 
Ste 206 Metairie, 
LA 70001

Coburn's 
Supply      
1300 
Ridgefield RD. 
Thibodaux, LA 
70301

Cimsco, Inc. 
1840 L and A 
Rd. Metairie, 
LA 70001

Baton Rouge 
Winwater 
Works 8940 
Buzbee Dr. 
Baton Rouge, 
LA 70809

Section 20 $13,092.00 $14,030.26 $13,101.00 No Bid
Section 21 $3,067.75 $3,851.59 $3,245.50 No Bid
Section 22 No Bid $659.21 $58.00 $250.00
Section 23 $300.00 $305.00 $305.00 $450.00
Section 24 $1,663.30 $589.59 $658.25 No Bid
Section 25 No Bid No Bid $59.50 No Bid
Section 26 $392.50 $380.58 $367.00 No BId
Section 27 $60.00 $63.39 $68.00 $68.00
Section 28 $200.00 $202.67 $279.00 No Bid
Section 29 $152.00 No Bid $245.00 $288.00
Section 30 $103.00 $122.32 $122.00 $169.00
Section 31 No Bid $3,620.00 $3,655.00 $3,800.00
Section 32 $1,487.00 $1,236.50 $1,189.00 $890.00
Section 33 No Bid No BId $3,850.00 No Bid
Section 34 No Bid No Bid $289.42 No Bid
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